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N
utritionists say breakfast is the most 
important meal of the day. Number 
crunchers, especially those in many 
supermarket delis, will beg to differ. 
That’s because breakfast traditionally 

has taken a backseat to lunch and dinner 
as the meat and potatoes of the deli’s dol-
lars. No longer. Some delis, such as those 
with strong prepared food programs and 
in-store cafés, are jump-starting the day’s 
register rings by offering a repast for their 
early risers. This includes everything from 

grab-and-go to sit-down restaurant-style 
menu options. For those delis that don’t 
have a breakfast program, the good news is 
that it’s easier to implement than expected.

“We discovered breakfast was a missed 
sales opportunity several years ago, as we 
ventured into the morning offerings along 
with all the fast food restaurants and cof-
fee shops in the country,” says Richard 
Ferranda, foodservice and cheese director 
at Bristol Farms, a 12-store chain head-
quartered in Carson, CA. “We figured the 

stores are open early and we are selling 
coffee and juice to our customers already, 
maybe we should be offering some pre-
pared breakfast to our customers.”

What’s For Breakfast?
Breakfast is the most functional and 

routine meal of the day, according to the 
report, Transformation of the American 
Meal 2017, published by the Hartman 
Group Inc., a Bellevue, WA-headquartered 
food insutry research and consulting firm. 

BUILDING A DELI BREAKFAST PROGRAM

Don’t miss out on this lucrative day part that can 
add incremental sales to the department.
BY CAROL BAREUTHER
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